
Pensacola Dog Fancier’s Association 

Release of Liability 

I/we the undersigned (“Releasor(s)”) wish to participate and/or volunteer in Pensacola Dog Fancier’s Association (“PDFA”)  
membership and events (“Events”) either with or without my dog(s) participation and hereby assume all risks of engaging in Events 
as indicated below.  

I/we understand that dog related activities are not without inherent risk and can be hazardous and carry the potential for death, 
serious injury and loss.  The risks include, but are not limited to those caused by actions of other people, including participants, 
club members, volunteers and canine companions involved in the Event.  In consideration of taking part in any Events, I assume all 
risks involved, including but not limited to those that are unforeseen arising from or in consequence of participation in any club 
Event and agree to indemnify and save harmless from any and all loss and expenses, including legal fees and costs by reason of 
the liability imposed upon any of the “Releasees”, as defined below.  I hereby take action for myself, my executors, administrators, 
heirs, next of kin, successors and assigns as follows: 

I/we agree to hold PDFA, its members, directors, officers, agents and assigns, superintendents, show secretary, employees, 
volunteers of PDFA (the “Releasees”) harmless from any and all liability, claim, costs, loses, expense or compensation of 
whatever nature, including attorney’s fees, for loss damage or injury to persons or property sustained by me, my heirs, personal 
representatives, successors and assigns resulting from or in any way connected to my participation in PDFA Events.  This includes 
but is not limited to any claim for loss or injury which may be alleged to have been caused either directly or indirectly by the 
negligence or fault of the Releasees or any participant or canine involved in a PDFA event, while in or upon the training grounds, 
show grounds, trial premises, or venue where a PDFA Event, function or activity is being held.  I/we further agree to hold the 
Releasees harmless from any claim or injury to my dog(s), whether such loss, disappearance, theft, damage or injury be caused or 
alleged to be caused by the negligence or fault of the Releasees or any other person, or animal involved or attending such PDFA 
event. 

I/we agree that as the owner(s) of the dog(s) I bring to a PDFA Event, I/we are solely responsible for the dog(s) physical control and 
undisclosed medical conditions, illnesses or temperament issues. 

I/we hereby give PDFA my/our permission to take and use photographs, and/or video of me/us and my/our dog(s) for any purpose 
whatsoever, including without limitation for marketing and advertising purposes and without remuneration.  Al photographs and 
videos are the property of PDFA. 

As a fancier of purebred dogs, I/we wish to apply for/continue membership in the PDFA.  I/we by signature below agree to abide by 
the constitution and by-laws of the Pensacola Dog Fanciers’ Association, Inc., the PDFA Code of Ethics and rules of the American 
Kennel Club. 

I certify that I have read this document in its entirety, and I fully understand its content.  I am aware that this Release of Liability is a 
contract signed of my own free will. 

Member Signature:___________________________  Member Signature:__________________________ 

Member Name:______________________________  Member Name:_____________________________ 

Date: _______________________    Date: ___________________________ 

Address:______________________________   Address:______________________________ 

                   ______________________________    ______________________________ 

Phone:   ___________________________   Phone: ___________________________ 

Email:___________________________________   Email:______________________________ 


